
Ndovu Nyamu
Farm Ltd
Ndovu Nyamu
Farm Ltd is an
export-focused
agribusiness
specializing in
the large-scale
production of
fresh and dry
chili peppers.
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Based in Nairobi, Kenya, and
operating out of Kitui County,
we are a company driven by
innovation, integrity, and
international quality standards.
Since our establishment in 2018,
our journey has been rooted in
excellence, starting from
horticulture and expanding into
high-demand chili cultivation
and value addition. Our core
strength lies in producing
export-grade chili varieties —
including Fresh Green Finger
Chili, Fresh Red Chili, and Dry
Red Chili — customized in
packaging for both wholesale
and supermarket retail
channels. With a minimum
order quantity of 5,000 kg and a
monthly dry chili supply
capacity of up to two 40-ton
containers, we cater to large-
scale buyers seeking reliability
and volume without
compromising on quality. 
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Contact Us
6866 – 00200
NAIROBI, KENYA
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